FACT SHEET

2021 National Fuel Gas Code — Summary List of Revisions rev. 132020

A(}é\

American Gas Association

This fact sheet provides a summary of the significant revisions to the 2018 National Fuel Gas Code approved by the National Fuel Gas Code Committee, ASC Z223 / NFPA 54. These revisions are
prelimianry and subject to final committee ballot and ANSI BSR approval. Once approved, they will be published in the 2021 edition of the National Fuel Gas Code.

The requirements in previous code editions, in local jurisdictions, or in specific situations, may differ. The fact sheet is not intended to replace knowledge of applicable local and national codes or
address specific situations. The user should consult a competent professional and be thoroughly familiar with all applicable local codes, and the specific manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
REVISED - Terminology changes throughout the code to
Various Various |Engineering methods use a standard phrase “engineering methods” and delete | The term is revised to be used consistently throughout the code.
the qualifier “other.”
- REVISED — Add “appliances” and “equipment” to the list |, . . L
1.4 1.4 Equivalency of installations that can be approved under equivalency. This revision corrects an omission to the code.
REVISED - Add newly referenced standards and updated |Updating references to their most recent editions. Newly referenced standards in the
Chapter 2| Chapter 2 |Referenced Standards existing. code are added to the chapter in accordance with the style manual.
333 3 Air Conditioning definition [DELETED Air Condl_tlpmng_ isa W|d_ely u_sed term that doe_s not need to tge_ defined in the Code
as the definition is essentially identical to the dictionary definition.
B . . The revision will include CNG fueling appliances under the appliance definition and
3.35 3.34 Appliance definition EEIVESED Updated to include appliances that compress make them subject to the code’s requirements. CNG fuel appliances are used to
gas. compress natural gas.
3351 3 Automatically Controlled DELETED The term is not used in the Code, other than in the definition. Terms that are not
R Appliance definition used in the document should not be defined.
The term "engineering method" has been used in the Code for a number of years,
3 3334 Englr_1e_er|ng Methods NEW — General definition added. and_there_ have been different interpretations c_Jf Wh_o can perfo_rm designs using an
definition engineering method. The results of some engineering calculations can be
summarized in tables, and graphs, or automated in software.
The point of delivery term is used in many locations within the code but there was
- 3.3.78 |Point of Delivery definition [INEW — Definition added and reference to 1.1.1.1 (A). no definition provided. The term is defined in scoping section 1.1.1.1 (A) which
may be overlooked or hard to find by code users.
- . ... |REVISED - The term is expanded to include “design” as |The revision does not change the meaning or intent of the definition but further
3381 3.382 |Qualified Agency definition part of the qualified agency’s responsibility. clarifies the stages of a project that must comply with the code.
- REVISED - Revise to include “design” and “installation” |This change is a result of a revision to 3.3.82 definition and also editorial changes to
4.1 41 Qualified Agency . . = A
to the list requiring the use of a qualified agency. improve grammar.
NEW — Coverage added that where an engineering method | This revision clarifies what an engineering method is and who can use such method.
45 is used the AHJ has the authority to require submittal of | This codifies what has been allowed in the Code for decades, the use of pipe and
- A 4'5(3) Engineering Methods various types of documentation. New Annex A guidance |vent sizing tables which are used by designers and the Authority Having

added providing a description of the types of persons that
can undertake an engineering method.

Jurisdiction. It also will require the person submitting the calculation to provide
their qualifications on the method used.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

1




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
Maximum operating REVISED - Piping using joints made with LC4  |Press—connect fittings listed to ANSI LC4 are listed for up to 125 psi fuel gas systems.
5.5.4 5.4.4 . o fittings can exceed the 5-psi maximum limit in This revision includes an additional joining method for systems over 5 PSI inside
pressure in buildings buildi -
uildings. buildings.
56.13 B Other materials DELETED Materi_als not_specified in the god_e are covered by the equivalency clause in Section 1.4
and this deletion removes subjective language.
REVISED — The term “compounds” is revised to
5564 “sealing materials” and the use of a sealing' The text is revised to _define t.he material in the requirement and the glefinitiqn in Cr_]apter 3
56.6.4 5 5 6 4 > |Thread ioint seali material is now required. The sealing materials |is deleted. The specific mention of LP—gas was removed as the requirement is applicable
joint sealing b . - o o : - . -
55643 must be c_ompatlble with the pipe and flttmgs and [to all fuel gases. In gddltlon, the code did not prewougly require thg use of sealing
the material must be non—hardening and suitable |materials, so a requirement has been added to reflect industry practice.
to the fuel gas to be supplied.
REVISED - Polyamide heat fusion fittings are
5.6.6 (2) 5.5.8 (2) |Plastic piping joints and added along with its ASTM standard. The ASTM now has a separate polyamide standard. Both polyamide and polyethylene are
A5.6 A5.6 fittings existing code coverage for ASTM D2513 is acceptable plastic piping materials.
updated to refer to only polyethylene fittings.
REVISED - Section is revised to refer to the
5.85 5.75 Regulator vents regulator vent installation requirements under a  |All regulator coverage consolidated under new section 5.14
new section 5.14.
5851 - Line and gas appliance DELETED All regulator coverage consolidated under new section 5.14
5.85.2 pressure regulators
5.8.6 - Bypass piping DELETED The paragraph is not needed since it allowed a bypass which is not prohibited by the code.
REVISED — The selection of a manual shutoff
valve shall be in accordance with the new Table
5.11. The table includes various valves by rated
operating pressure and requires valves to meet the | This revision provides code users with a valve selection table based on available and
512 5.11 Shutoff valves shown product standard. The existing acceptable valve standards. The table will help ensure the appropriate valve is selected for
' Table 5.11 requirement that valves sized 1 in. or smaller be |the intended application. The requirement to be labeled has been added to facilitate
listed is retained but they also now must be inspection and to identify that the device complies with a standard.
labeled. The outdoor use of any selected valve
must be in accordance with the manufacturer’s
recommendation.
Pressure regulator and NEW — All of the_eX|st|ng |nstallafuon The code had addressed venting of pressure control devices in several sections. The
- 5.14 - requirements for line and gas appliance regulators - . : - -
pressure control venting . - change would improve clarity by placing them all into one section.
is consolidated.
The pre-2006 Table 6.3.1(d) excluded pipe length rows 70 ft and 90 ft, which was
Table Table Undiluted propane sch. 40 |REVISED — All capacities above the 60 ft length |inconsistent with all other LP pipe sizing tables. The error occurred when transferring the
6.3.1(d) 6.3.1(d) |sizing table are corrected. excel spreadsheet calculated capacities to this table since the excel spreadsheet included

70 ft and 90 ft. The result is overstating capacities for all pipe lengths above 60 ft.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

2




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
REVISED - The requirement that a conduit be
used to protect buried gas lines when a minimum |“Pipe” includes only rigid pipe products such as schedule 40. “Piping” includes both rigid
7121 (B) 7.1.21(B) of 12 in. ground cover is used is applied to both  |and tubing products. Tubing should be allowed to be installed less than the 12—inch
A. 7' 1'2 (B) A.7.1.2 ®) Buried pipe protection pipe and tubing (piping). The allowance for minimum where it is protected. In addition, bridge (shielded) was removed because it is
T T bridging (shielded) is deleted. Annex A guidance [too ambiguous. Annex material was added to clarify that conduit is not limited to electrical
is added on types of conduit material and its conduit.
purpose.
. . - . - This revision eliminates the use of sealant materials that could hasten corrosion or other
7.15 7.15(@3) \Ijvlzflllng through foundation NIEI\QV _ar?(?grelgiz Srflzltirr]it:use compatible with the chemical reaction of the affected components. The revision will also promote consistency
PIPINg ) with other building and plumbing codes.
Pining elevation above Installing above the ground will help ensure that piping is not in contact with corrosive
- 7.2.1(5) rSdegor roof NEW — Require a minimum 3 % inches. environments and does not sit in standing water. The 3 % inch clearance allows for debris
g to pass underneath rather than be caught.
Pinina throuah above This revision eliminates the use of sealant materials that could hasten corrosion or other
- 7.2.1 (6) rgun% wallsg NEW — Require compatible sealants. chemical reaction of the affected components. The revision will also promote consistency
g with other building and plumbing codes.
7.2.2 A7.72.222 Protective coating gﬁ::’é?g:iﬁéﬁ [ga;‘:g,;lcﬁigz?nﬁ &I,??Jg,i(t,:at Annex material is added to clarify that painting is an acceptable method.
726.4 77é266441 Pining on roofs bReE;fSaEtli%r:;)Zevgiﬂzr:gc:??:g:g ti rét :Qaltaigjmbg 3 % inch minimum elevation provides an enforceable minimum dimension and is
o 7.2.6.4.2 ping 2.3 % inch minimum P Y| consistent with other building codes.
7 8.1 throuah aRniLsogﬁlizu;;Z%gﬁu"rg\r/}];gts :Srf ;le(z,zztzfe A new section and definition is added for "System Shutoff Valves" to replace "Main Gas
7.8.2.1 ' 7 812 9 Accessibility of gas valves renan?e d “system shuto ff,', to be Cogn sistent with Shutoff Valve" and clarify the difference between the service shutoff valve and system
o definition cﬁanges shutoff valve. The section is being revised to reflect this change.
The natural gas utility’s service shutoff valve has been used to serve as a building owner’s
maintenance valve and the emergency shutoff valve. Federal regulations now require that
7.84 these valves be operated only by a qualified person. Home owners and other members of
B A784 System shutoff valves NEW —New coverage for these valves. the public are not considered to be a qualified person. Some gas utilities have begun to
install a second whole building shutoff valve that can be operated by the home owner or
agency after the point of delivery.
7124 7124 Electrical isolation of glni\alr\{r: F:ﬁglé:ﬁgig'e\lsﬁgr': f'itt'i?]g E:)srlicr)wgttglled Underground piping may be subject to increased corrosive forces where it is not isolated
" " piping underg?ound g PIpIng from the aboveground piping systems.
- . Listed appliances should only be converted where permitted by the manufacturer and in
913 913 Tvnes of gases (FzzoEn\\lea?tEc?o;lR e\?vtﬁgfellsgsgsfe%hgnces to be accordance with their specific instructions. The committee has become aware of certain
o - yp 9 manufact rer}; instr th)ions y gas suppliers converting listed unvented heaters without referring to the manufacturer's
wactu u ' installation instructions.
9.1.16 - s\ic:ieggate capacity of DELETED Delete duplicate coverage. The section was moved into 5.1.2 for the 2018 edition.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

3




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
9.118 9117 Gas appliance pressure REVISED - Gas appliance regulators must be This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
o - regulators listed to ANSI Z21.18/CSA 6.3. which provides some assurance that the regulator is safe for the intended purpose.
9.1.19 - Venting of gas appliance DELETED All regulator coverage consolidated under new section 5.14.
pressure regulators
Add a reference to the National Electrical Code (NEC-NFPA 70) to help ensure that the
REVISED - Specific electrical outlet and National Fuel Gas Code does not conflict with NEC requirements. The NEC may have
9.4.23 9.4.2.3  |Electrical outlet disconnecting means deleted and a reference to  |additional requirements and may also have outlet requirements based on the type of
NFPA 70 added. installations (i.e., multiple appliances on the same roof) which may allow one outlet to
serve multiple appliances.
REVISED — Prohibit the use of CSST through an
Appliance connections appliance’s metal housing where the appliance is |The CSST product standard contains the same restriction which is being added to the code
9.6.1(5) 9.6.1(5) - f - - ;
using CSST also connected to a metallic vent that terminates  |for consistency and to help ensure compliance.
above the roof.
NEW - Draft hood appliances are allowed in
Appliance locations with IOC"’}“O”S W.here a furr)ace or other air hgndlmg. This requirement was intended to apply to all draft hood-equipped appliances, not just
- 10.1.3 - equipment is located if the furnace or air handling -
air handlers - . - water heaters (2018 code section 10.27.1.1).
equipment is connected to ducts that terminate
outside of the space.
NEW — Gas—fired air conditioning appliances are . . . . . . .
- 1021 |Air conditioning appliance [to be listed to ANSI Z21.40.1/CSA 2.91 or ANSI VTVE'.Effvﬁf,'v".3ef‘iﬂl%?aiiifiﬁfetﬁ]iftﬂitid t:’i;L‘seaizps';‘;it}frﬁhrgﬁgf;”deNda“L’?ac'J sseta“dard
721.40.2/CSA 2.92. P PP purpose.
10.2.3 10.2.4 Air conditioning clearances SSQ{SED — Unlisted appliance requirements are Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
Furnace plenums and air REVISED - The code requirements for furnace | The code requires that all listed appliances be installed in accordance with manufacturers’
10.2.5 10.2.6 ducts P plenums supplied by the manufacturer or plenums |instructions in 10.1.1 which would include any plenums used with a listed air conditioning
to be constructed on site are deleted. appliance.
10.2.7 10.2.8 Electrical switches REVISED - Delete specific electrical location This revision is to help ensure that the National Fuel Gas Code does not conflict with NEC
- - coverage and add a reference to NFPA 70. requirements and to allow other types of installations that may be permitted by the NEC. .
NEW — Furnaces and low pressure boilers with  |This revision requires products with input ratings up to 400,000 Btu/hr to be listed to the
1031 input of 400,000 Btu/hr or less are to be listed. applicable American National Standard which provides some assurance that the appliance
- . Furnace and boiler Furnaces are to be listed to ANSI Z21.47/CSA 2.3|is safe for the intended purpose. This size was specified because it covers most common
10.3.1.1 ; : A ) . ! o -
and low pressure boilers listed to ANSI residential and commercial appliances. No appliance standards are specified for high
Z21.13/CSA 4.9. pressure boilers of any input.
The code continues to permit the installation of low pressure boilers and furnaces above
NEW — Furnaces and boilers having input ratings 400,000 that meet, or are listed to, other industry standards. No appliance standards are
- 10.3.1.2  |Furnace and boiler greater than 400,000 Btu/hr are to be listed or be |specified for high pressure boilers of any input to allow for manufacturer flexibility. High

in accordance with 9.1.1.2 and 9.1.1.3.

input furnaces and boilers that are not listed must be approved and suitable for the
installation as required in sections 9.1.1.2 and 9.1.1.3.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

4




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
REVISED — Return air prohibited from being This revision would help to prevent some installers from claiming that the 10.3.7.4 return
10.3.7.4 10.3.8.4 |Furnace ducts taken from the mechanical room containing the  |air duct sealing requirement is not needed when they add a small opening in the supply
furnace. duct in the mechanical room.
NEW — Clothes dryers shall be listed in . . . . . . .
3 1041 Clothes dryers accordance with ANSI 221 5.1/CSA 7.1 or ANSI ThI.S revision requires products to be listed tq the a_ppllcable Ame_rlcan National Standard
which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
Z2152/CSA7.2.
10.4.1 10.4.2 Clothes dryer clearance REVISED - Unlisted requirements are deleted.  |Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
10.4.5.4 - Exhaust ducts DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
NEW — Decorative appliances for installation in
B . . vented fireplaces shall be listed in accordance This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
1061 Decorative appliances with ANSI which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
Z21.60/CSA 2.26.
Unlisted decorative . - . . . . .
10.6.3.3 - appliances DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
B 1071 Vented aas fireplaces NEW - Fireplaces shall be listed in accordance  |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
o 9 P with ANSI Z21.50/CSA 2.22. which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
10.7.2 (2) . .
Table - .Un“StEd. fireplace DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
installation
10.6.2.3
Industrial air heaters. non- REVISED — The name of the appliances is Sections 10.8 and 10.9 covering the 2 types of gas-fired industrial air heaters are
10.8 through | 10.8 through recirculating and ' updated to their current ANSI standard’s name.  |repetitive, so they have been combined to delete duplication. The titles for the appliances
10.8.8 10.8.8 : Ing Sections 10.8 and 10.9 are consolidated. No new [have been revised to reflect the name changes in the listing standards. Some requirements
recirculating - . ; : .
technical requirements are added. were revised to apply to both types of appliances because they are applicable to both.
10.9 through Industrial air heaters, Recirculating direct gas fired heater coverage is consolidated with non—recirculating
- - - DELETED . -
10.9.8 recirculating heaters in section 10.8.
NEW — Duct furnaces with inputs of 10 mBtu/hr |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
- 10.9.1 Duct furnace or less shall be listed in accordance with ANSI which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose. The 10
Z83.8/CSA 2.6. mBtu/hr limit was added since that is the limit in the standard.
10.10.1 (2) - gg;'fatﬁgegua furnace DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
10.10.6.3 - Duct furnace, Iocate_d .. IDELETED The requirement is vague and can lead to inconsistent enforcement.
upstream from cooling unit
10.9.7.3 Duct furnace, examples of |REVISED — Delete the sentence which provides a
10.10.6.4 A 16 9 7 3 corrosion resistant list of materials that are considered corrosion This sentence is advisory and doesn't contain a requirement.
T Imaterials resistant and relocate it to the annex.
NEW — Floor furnaces shall be listed in This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
- 10.10.1  |Floor furnaces

accordance with ANSI Z21.86/CSA 2.32.

which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

5




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
10.11.12) Unlisted appli DELETED Unlisted appli deleted since the appliance is required to be listed
101122 - nlisted appliances nlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
Floor mounted food service NEW - F_Ioor-_mounted food service appliances This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
- 10.11.1 . shall be listed in accordance with ANSI . . . : .
appliances 783.11/CSA 1.8 which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
10.12.3 - ggélrs;ﬁgezppllance DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
3 10121 Counter food service NEW — Food service counter appliances shall be |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
- appliances listed to ANSI Z83.11/CSA 1.8. which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
Listed counter food service REVISED - Delete the listed examples of food | The list of examples of food service counter appliances is deleted as a list is never
10.13.2 10.12.3 service counter appliances and the requirement  |complete. The requirement that the appliances be set on their own bases or legs is deleted
clearances - - - ! A .
that they be installed on their own base for legs. |as this should be in the manufacturer's instructions.
10.13.4 Unlisted counter food . . . . . . .
10135 - service clearances DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
B 10131 Household cooking NEW — Household cooking appliances shall be  |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
" appliances listed in accordance with ANSI Z21.1/CSA 1.1. |which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
Household cooking
10.14.2 (2) - appliances equipped with |DELETED No such products are currently being manufactured.
room heaters
Level installation of This requirement is included in the listed appliance manufacturer's installation
10.14.3 - household cooking DELETED SIS req PP
A instructions.
appliances
NEW - Infrared heaters having an input rating of
400,000 Btu/hr or less shall be listed in This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
- 10.16.1 |Infrared heaters . - . . H .
accordance with ANSI which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
Z783.19/CSA 2.35 or ANSI Z83.20/CSA 2.34.
REVISED — Open-top broiler units shall be listed |, . . . . . . .
loins | 10171 |open-TopSrolers |m koo wih ANSI Z83LUCSA Laor |15/ 08 S0 et e e st Aeran o) Sncae
ANSI Z21.1/CSA 1.1. P PP purpose.
10.18.2 - Unlisted open-top broilers |DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
REVISED - Outdoor cooking appliances shall be
10.19 10.18 Outdoor cooking listed in accordance with ANSI Z83.11/CSA 1.8, |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
' ' appliances ANSI Z21.58/CSA 1.6, or ANSI Z21.89/CSA which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
1.18.
10.19.1 Unlisted outdoor cooking . . . . . . .
10.19.2 - appliances DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

6




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
3 10191 |Pool heaters NEW — Pool heaters shall be listed in accordance |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
e with ANSI Z21.56/CSA 4.7. which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
136220623(? - Unlisted pool heaters DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
B 10201  |Refrigerators NEW — Refrigerators shall be listed in accordance |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
o g with ANSI Z21.19/CSA 1.4. which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
10211 NEW — Vented room heaters shall be listed in Thl§ revision requwes'vented room heaters to be listed to the ap.pllcab.le American
. National Standard which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the
- 10.21.1.1 * |Room heaters accordance with ANSI Z21.86/CSA 2.32 or ANSI intended purpose. Unvented room heaters were previously required to be listed and the
10.21.1.2 721.88/CSA 2.33. \Cea purpose. P yreq
requirement is relocated.
10.22.2 B Unvented room heater RELOCATED - The listing requirement moved |The provision is relocated for consistency with the format change adopted for other listed
" listing t0 10.21.1.2. appliances and their referenced standard.
Clearances for room Clearance requirements for all types of room heaters will be contained in the installation
10.22.4 - heaters DELETED instructions for the listed appliances. All appliances are to be listed so coverage for
unlisted appliances is deleted.
B 10241 |Unit heaters NEW — Unit heaters shall be listed in accordance |This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
o with ANSI Z83.8/CSA 2.6. which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
10.25.2.1 (2) - t‘:g::gﬁgel;mt heaters DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
B 10251 |Wall furnaces NEW — Wall furnaces shall be listed in This revision requires products to be listed to the applicable American National Standard
o accordance with ANSI Z21.86/CSA 2.32. which provides some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.
10.26.1.2 - Unlisted wall furnaces DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
NEW — Water heaters shall be listed in . - . . . . .
- | a0z e s wih ANSI Z21.101/CSA 4. or | 1S40 S0 rodets b It e st A Moo Stncar
ANSI 721.10.3/CSA 4.3. P PP pUrpose.
10.27.1.1 - Water heaters in Locations DELETED Relocated to 10.1.3 and made applicable to all draft hood appliances.
with Air—Handlers
10.27.2.2 - (L:Jlgélfatﬁge\;\/ater heater DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
REVISED — The relief device had been . - . . . . .
10.27.3 10.26.4  |Pressure relief devices previously required to be listed and is revised to \m'iirr]evr'cs)'voigggzggisazrs%?;ﬁit%gte tuztzd t:)i;:geaiz pslé(;:k}fr?hrgﬁgtce a:]n dgjatlﬁpacl)ssetandard
require listing to ANSI Z21.22/CSA 4.4. P PP purpose.
. . . An ANSI standard is available for non-residential CNG fueling appliances which differs
. . REVISED — Non-residential CNG fueling . . - . ) : .
10.28 10.27 Non-residential CNG appliances coverage is added and they shall be from residential CNG fueling appliances. Coverage for these fueling appliances is added

fueling appliances

listed in accordance with ANSI/CSA NGV 5.2.

to require they be listed to the applicable American National Standard which provides
some assurance that the appliance is safe for the intended purpose.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

7




Section Numbering

Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
REVISED — The fuel cell power plant had been . . . . . . .
10.30 10.29 Fuel cell power plants previously required to be listed and is revised to \TV?]IiSCfzevr!(s)l\;)igggzg::l(eesaigi?’grﬁiset%:te tlr:ztzd tﬂ;ﬂi;ﬁ p;;(;zl}fr'?hrzﬁﬂtz indle\:jatlﬁpaéssetandard
require listing to the ANSI/CSA FC 1. P PP purpose.
REVISED - Outdoor open flame decorative . . . . . . .
toaty | soany |QUOODSANTE ppiacs sl et ot |[1VISVIIR eues bt s et 0 syt A aon S
PP ANSI 221.97/CSA 2.41. P PP purpose.
10.31.2 - ;Jpnplllis;ﬁ(gec;utdoor decorative DELETED Unlisted appliance coverage deleted since the appliance is required to be listed.
NEW — Add new coverage for outdoor infrared
B 10.31 Outdoor infrared patio heaters for residential and commercial The proposal is intended to allow for the installation of outdoor infrared heaters in
' heaters applications and require them to be listed in accordance with the standard in both residential and commercial applications.
accordance with ANSI Z83.26/CSA 2.27.
e NEW - Direct vent appliances through-the-wall . - . - .
B 1235.2 Thro_ugh_ the-wall vent clearances shall be in accordance with a revised Sldg wall vent termination coverage including direct vent that were located under various
terminations 1291 sections are consolidated into a revised 12.9.1.
12436 B Side wall vent terminations RELOCATED - The requirement moved to a Side wall vent termination coverage located under various sections has been consolidated
T new Table 12.9.1 and Figure 12.9.1. into a revised 12.9.1.
126.4.2 B Unlined chimney continued DELETED The exception is removed because appliance efficiency has sufficiently changed so that
use this exception can no longer apply.
REVISED - Reorganize current requirements into
12.9 anew 12.9.1 and Figure 12.9.1. Add new This revision coordinates the figure with clearances contained in the ANSI product
129.1 12.9 clearance distances when specified by the standards. In addition, the clearances to vent terminals is expanded to cover commonly
12.9.2 Table 12.9.1 |Side wall vent clearances |manufacturer from non-openable window, soffit, |encountered installation situations such as inside corners, locations under decks and
12.9.3 Figure 12.9.1 outside corner and inside corner. Add new 12 in. |balconies, regulator vents, soffits, etc. The condensate drain requirement is being relocated
12.9.4 minimum beneath veranda, porch, deck or to section 12.10.
balcony where two or more sides are open.
REVISED - Delete the dgtermmatlon b"f‘SEd O | This revision coordinates with the revision to section 12.9 that includes the nuisance or
local experience. Relocation of the requirement - - - : -
. . - - - hazard consideration and therefore that coverage in section 12.10.2 is no longer needed.
12.10.2 12.10.2  |Condensation disposal that the drains and condensate disposal be in . - h - g A
! L. . The requirement that drains be in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions is
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation - .
. - relocated from 12.9.4 to the more appropriate section 12.10.2.
instructions.
It has been common practice of cutting a hole in the side of a single-wall vent connector
_ NEW — The fittings must be of a manufactured  |and inserting another vent connector into the hole. The connector often projects into the
- 12.11.7  |Tee and wye fittings - . . L ]
type. interior of the other connector creating an obstruction as well as the joint gap will
introduce extra air which may impact overall vent performance.
121322 B Special design draft hood |DELETED Section 12.13.2 applies to listed appliances. A use of a draft hood that is not listed with the

appliance will invalidate the listing of that appliance.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved

8




Section Numbering
Subject Description of Change Reason
2018 2021
The code does not currently acknowledge the common use of baffles which are commonly
NEW — Requires balancing baffles to be utilized in mechanical draft systems. These baffles are manually adjusted at the time of
12142 mechanicaI(I] locked in ogition rior to the installation and then mechanically fixed into position after determination of the proper
B 12'14'3 Balancing baffles appliance be%ng placed i?} serviccf The baffle position of each baffle for a multiple appliance system. The code specifically addresses
o . ' - “Manually Operated Dampers” in the prohibition cited in Section 12.14. “Fixed baffles”
Al2142 Lnnufﬁge lzIrSthetgfliLb%?é Add Annex A guidance are also addressed as allowable in that section. The problem arises in that it has been
purp ' interpreted that a baffle used as a balancing baffle should be viewed as “manually
adjustable” and hence is prohibited.
A12.9 - Exit terminal figure DELETED A revised figure is added into the code as Figure 12.9.1.
REVISED - Notification of a gas leak is to be . . .
Suggested emergency - - Emergency responders contacted through 911 will contact the appropriate agencies,
D.1 D1 procedure for gas leaks irze:jc‘iaelelié/dcallmg 911. The call to the gas supplier following their protocols.
REVISED - Delete the guidance allowin .
Flooded appliance controls and componentg t0 be replaced a?]d add a AHRI recommends replacement of app_llances, r_egard_less gf the damage stateor
G444 G444 replacement recommendation that the entire anoliance be assessment. Under current (4), a servicing technician is going to have to decide, which
P replaced PP may not correspond to what AHRI and the manufacturers they represent recommend.
Annex K Annex K [Standards List 5 dF}t\i/c:rS\sl,ED — All standards are update to current Updating references to their most recent editions.

Notice and Disclaimer of Liability Concerning the Use of AGA Documents

The AGA disclaim liability for any personal injury, property or other damages of any nature whatsoever, whether special, indirect, consequential or compensatory,
directly or indirectly resulting from the publication, use of, or reliance on this document. The AGA also make no guaranty or warranty as to the accuracy or
completeness of any information published herein.

In issuing and making this document available, the AGA are not undertaking to render professional or other services for or on behalf of any person or entity. Nor is
the AGA undertaking to perform any duty owed by any person or entity to someone else. Anyone using this document should rely on his or her own independent
judgment or, as appropriate, seek the advice of a competent professional in determining the exercise of reasonable care in any given circumstances.

The AGA have no power, nor do they undertake, to police or enforce compliance with the contents of this document. Nor does the AGA list, certify, test, or inspect
products, designs, or installations for compliance with this document. Any certification or other statement of compliance with the requirements of this document shall
not be attributable to the AGA and is solely the responsibility of the certifier or maker of the statement.

Copyright © 2020 by American Gas Association, All Rights Reserved
9




	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page
	Blank Page



